Schroeder, Stephen

From: Howard <howardnsmith@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 4:36 PM
To: Schroeder, Stephen

Subject: RE: Conservation Easement Amendment

| understand that we will be responsible for all costs incurred and that we will be notified of the amount before it is
started.
Howard Smith

From: Schroeder, Stephen

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 3:57 PM

To: Howard

Subject: RE: Conservation Easement Amendment

Mr. Smith

Please provide a map of the property showing the approximate location of the sink in question. Also please
acknowledge that if we pursue an amendment to the conservation easement, you (or the landowner) will be required to
pay all costs associated with the amendment, including staff time and legal fees incurred.

I have had several internal discussions regarding your request and hope to get a chance to discuss it with my boss this
afternoon or early next week. We are exploring not only the amendment but other, temporary solutions that we may
be able to agree too. | am out of the office on Friday but feel free to call me Tuesday if you haven’t heard from me by 1
oclock.
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